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Motion to: 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

As an emergency interim measure a immediate ban on any structures more 
than 10 years old being brought on to the Reservation. This will be placed on 
a general membership meeting in January 2004. This emergency measure is 
in direct c01Telation with the motion made January 9, 2000 item number five, 
"Bo Mazzetti asked the band members in attendance if they would consider 
passing a resolution or at least bringing to vote a motion that would forbid 
any moving of structures on the reservation older than 10 years. Bo Mazzetti 
made a motion that no mobile home or structure··.9Jder than 10 years could be 
moved onto the reservation. Jerri Mazzetti seconded the motion. With 19 in 
favor, 2 opposed, and O abstaining. 

Effective October 26, 2003 the above General Membership motion will be 
implemented based on the action of that meeting:: .P1ior to any new trailer or 
dwelling being brought within the Rincon Reservation's Exterior Boundaries 
proper documentation must be submitted to the Rincan Housing Depa1tment 
that certifies the age of the dwelling. All tribal members and their tenants 
must follow this policy. Any shucture what so ever must be 10 years or 
newer. Violators of this policy will have their per.capita payments forfeited 
until the unit is removed from the reservation's exterior boundaries. This 
emergency policy is to be better defined in the future. 

Bo Mazzetti 
Vice Chnirmnn 

Vernon Wright 
Council Member 

Stephanie Spencer 
Council Member 

Gilbert Parada 
Council Member 
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Motion by: 
Second by: 
Vote: 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 
 

 

Also prior to per capita payments beginning again (with no retroactive monies 
due for missed disbursements) proof must be submitted to the tribe, and 
reviewed by the housing department to make sure that individuals are in 
compliance with this policy, when the proof of compliance has been 
submitted and reviewed, per capita payments will commence on the next 
scheduled disbursement date. 
Bo Mazzetti 
Stephanie Spencer 
4-yes, 0-no, 0-abstain, I-absent 
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Respectfully Submitted, 

c~~v-P 
' Executive Secretary 




